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Stunning Property with 2000 Feet
Lake Frontage 
Price:  USD 588,000

Location:  Orange Walk District

Bedrooms:  6

MLS Number: H192301OW

Lot size:  15.00 Acre

Escape to your own private oasis with this stunning 15-acre
property, complete with over 2000 feet of lake frontage. Enjoy
breathtaking views and endless opportunities for relaxation and
recreation in complete seclusion. This property boasts a charming
3-bedroom main house, a cozy 3-bedroom Mennonite guest house,
and two separate worker quarters, providing ample space for
family, friends, and guests.Take advantage of the lake side BBQ area
and orchards, perfect for outdoor dining and entertaining. The
property is equipped with solar power and a diesel generator,
ensuring a reliable source of power at all times. The water
catchment system adds to the eco-friendliness of the property. The
full tool shed, complete with all the tools you need to maintain the
property, and a tractor with assorted attachments are added
bonuses for those who enjoy the convenience and peace of mind
that comes with having everything you need on hand. And for those
who love to explore, there are canoes for navigating the lagoon.For
those who enjoy farming tarpon, there are three ponds specifically
designed for that purpose, providing a unique and exciting
opportunity to raise one of the most prized fish in the world. The
large concrete pig sty is a rare find for those who enjoy raising
animals.Located in a private and secluded setting, yet just 25
minutes from the bustling Orange Walk Town and only one hour
from the Mexican border, this property offers the perfect balance of
peace and tranquility, with easy access to modern amenities and
attractions.Don't miss this rare opportunity to own a piece of
heaven on earth in complete privacy. Schedule your showing today!
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